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Dr. A.G. Srinivasamurthy, MD, is a Professor of General Medicine and the 
Dean (Medicine) at the Sri Siddhartha Academy of Higher Education. He led 
the planning and implementation of the SSAHE Initiative curriculum and 
oversees all aspects of curricular and academic issues for the SSAHE.  
 
Dr. A.G. Srinivasamurthy, is also the head of the Academy of distinguished 
Medical Educators at the Sri Siddhartha Medical College is an on campus 
institution of Sri Siddhartha Academy of Higher Education.  Dr. Murthy, has 
had extensive experience with the recruitment and training of medical 
graduate students. He has taught medicine in the under graduate and post 
graduate programme, 
 
He supports medical students in their professional development, specialty 
selection, and residency application. His fifteen year tenure as 
Dean/Principal provides him with broad perspective on the medical training 
pathway. 
 
Dr. Murthy’s major educational focus has been on professional development 
in both student and resident medical trainees. Examples of initiatives he has 
led include novel programming to prepare students for their clinical 
clerkships, critical event counseling to harness transformative learning 
opportunities, aggressive longitudinal counseling to promote resident 
scholarship, and the creation of a formal physician residency training 
pathway. Other work has focused on the centralization and development of 
new administrative resources to enhance residency and fellowship training in 
the age of the Accreditation Committee of Graduate Medical Education’s. 
 
An important feature of Dr. Murthy’s efforts to promote professional 
development in both residents and students is an emphasis on social justice. 
As a Dean he enhanced diversity in the residency programme through the 
implementation of a visiting clerkship program and the development of a 
minority resident organization.  He has enhanced quality and ethical 



 

 

standards of practice at the Sri Siddhartha Medical College, at which over 
ninety percent of SSAHE students serve before graduation.  
 
Dr. Murthy, works closely with the admission team and helps to oversee all 
aspects of the admission process at SSAHE, and his role in admissions 
includes the recruitment and support of prospective students throughout the 
SSAHE application process, as well as working with faculty and students of 
the Admissions Committee in forming each medical college class. 
 
Dr. Murthy, directs the Wellness Programs, oversees the Free 
Clinic experiences for students and helps to direct career advising and 
mentoring programs.  His work encourages students to reflect on their 
journey through medical training and empowers students to care for 
themselves in order to serve their patients and communities. 
 
 
Dr Murthy, born on 14th June 1951, Father Sri. A.V. Govinda Setty, He did his 
Graduate & Post graduate of Kasturba Medical College, Manipal, Mangalore, 
Karnataka.   
 
Dr. A.G. Srinivasamurthy, did his internship and residency training in 
Internal Medicine at the Kasturba Medical College. He joined the faculty at 
Kasturba Medical College, Mangalore, in General Medicine in 1978, and has 
served as Lecturer / Asst. Professor in Medicine Department in 1980;  
 
And he joined Sri Siddhartha Medical College as Assistant Professor on 1990; 
worked as Associate professor from 1992; and Professor & Head of the 
Department of Medicine from 1996; and as a senior faculty he has been 
endorsed as Dean/Principal from 2005.  
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